
Re: Update  

From donnie sherwood  
To  
Date 2024-06-04 10:50 
 

 Yes  I'm sure they do...and it's  a  nysdec364 online we can regis ter the highway 10wheeler and now 
do it evey 5 years  or so and jus t pay tipping fees  

On Tue, J un 4, 2024, 10:42 AM Elizabeth Pfis ter - Windsor Town Clerk  
wrote: 
Wow! That is really nice to work with people that care about what they do 
and put in the extra effort for a customer. I would get Mike Kithcart the info 
on certifying a truck and he can look into what needs to be done that would 
be awesome and save some $$. I know the Sewer District residents would 
appreciate it I am sure, I know they love to complain about making their 
quartly payments.  

--- 
Elizabeth "Liz" Pfister 
Town Clerk/Registrar/Tax Collector 
Town of Windsor 
124 Main Street 
Windsor, NY 13865 
607-655-2023 option 3 
Fax 607-655-2027 
www.windsorny.org 
On 2024-06-04 10:35, donnie sherwood wrote: 

Thank you for getting it done.It will help out the town for years.Also we can 
possibly look into getting one of our trucks classified so we can do our own 
haul out in the future. 
Also they did a nice job cleaning up all of the yard and put down straw and 
grass seed. 

On Tue, Jun 4, 2024, 10:34 AM Elizabeth Pfister - Windsor Town Clerk 
 wrote: 

Thank you Donnie, that sounds fantastic!  

--- 

http://www.windsorny.org/


Elizabeth "Liz" Pfister 
Town Clerk/Registrar/Tax Collector 
Town of Windsor 
124 Main Street 
Windsor, NY 13865 
607-655-2023 option 3 
Fax 607-655-2027 
www.windsorny.org 
On 2024-06-04 10:32, donnie sherwood wrote: 

Good morning Liz, 
Well the project wrapped up without any damage and everything looks 
great and is working in perfect order like it was new. 
The contractor put down hydraulic cement in the openings of the reed 
beds  where we had those new flood gates installed 2 years ago. We started 
pumping to it 2 weeks ago. Over all very satisfied with the reed bed clean 
out and looking forward for the utilization for years to come. 

On Tue, Jun 4, 2024, 9:45 AM Elizabeth Pfister - Windsor Town Clerk 
 wrote: 

Hi Donnie,  

Do you have an update for the Board on the sludge removal project? Or 
anything else you would like to let the Board know about? 

I'll be away the beginning of next week so I am trying to get info together 
for next Wednesdays meeting.  

Thanks,  

-- 
Elizabeth "Liz" Pfister 
Town Clerk/Registrar/Tax Collector 
Town of Windsor 
124 Main Street 
Windsor, NY 13865 
607-655-2023 option 3 
Fax 607-655-2027 
www.windsorny.org 
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